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Everything changes when Julie Riddle’s parents stumble across the wilderness survival guide How to Live in
the Woods on Pennies a Day. In 1977, when Riddle is seven years old, she and her family—fed up with the
challenges of city life—move to the foot of the Cabinet Mountains Wilderness in northwestern Montana. For
three years they live in the primitive basement of the log house they are building by hand in the harsh,
remote Montana woods. Meanwhile, haunted by the repressed memory of childhood sexual abuse, Riddle
struggles to come to terms with the dark shadows that plague her amid entrenched cultural and gender mores
enforced by enduring myths of the West.

As Riddle grapples with her own painful secrets, she discovers the world around her and its impact on
people—the demands of living in a rural, mountain community dependent on boom-and-bust mining and
logging industries, the health and environmental crises of the W. R. Grace asbestos contamination and EPA
cleanup, and the healing beauty of the Montana wild. More than simply a memoir about family and place,
The Solace of Stones explores Riddle’s coming of age and the complexities of memory, loss, and identity
borne by a family homesteading in the modern West.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Heck:

The book The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness (American Lives) can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book
The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness (American Lives)? Some of you have a different
opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right
now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, it is possible to give for
each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness
(American Lives) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can
look the enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

James Johnson:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of
them is this The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness (American Lives).

April Hanson:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through
Wilderness (American Lives) can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what
these textbooks have than the others?

Lee Villegas:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This kind of The Solace of Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness
(American Lives) can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have
point that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a
step for you to get success. This book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let us have The Solace of
Stones: Finding a Way through Wilderness (American Lives).
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