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Damen is a warrior hero to his people, and the rightful heir to the throne of Akielos, but when his half
brother seizes power, Damen is captured, stripped of his identity, and sent to serve the prince of an enemy
nation as a pleasure slave.

Beautiful, manipulative and deadly, his new master Prince Laurent epitomizes the worst of the court at Vere.
But in the lethal political web of the Veretian court, nothing is as it seems, and when Damen finds himself
caught up in a play for the throne, he must work together with Laurent to survive and save his country.

For Damen, there is just one rule: never, ever reveal his true identity. Because the one man Damen needs is
the one man who has more reason to hate him than anyone else . . .
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From reader reviews:

David Manning:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question due to the
fact just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Captive Prince: Book One of the
Captive Prince Trilogy to read.

Richard Brassell:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than
other is high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Captive Prince: Book
One of the Captive Prince Trilogy book as starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater
than just a book.

Bruce Williamson:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You will see that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you personally
is Captive Prince: Book One of the Captive Prince Trilogy this e-book consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration
when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Alice Edwards:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Captive Prince: Book
One of the Captive Prince Trilogy can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what
these publications have than the others?
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